

GLENVIEW PARK DISTRICT
2017 T-SHIRT UNIFORM BID

Bid Section	Sharp Sports	Marathon Sportswear	B.K. Distributors	Sunburst Sportswear
Section A - Camp T-Shirts	\$ 11,271.53	\$ 15,226.70	\$ 18,003.75	\$ 12,760.74
Section B - Water T-Shirts	\$ 2,125.62	No Bid	\$ 2,740.20	\$ 2,069.88
Section C - Backpacks	\$ 3,680.16	\$ 2,000.90	\$ 2,670.36	No Bid
Section D - Aquatics Apparel	\$ 7,641.86	\$ 7,867.15	\$ 9,833.20	No Bid
Section E - Park Services	\$2,191.60	\$2,258.35	\$2,844.33	\$2,295.58
Section F - Youth Flag Football Uniforms	\$ 5,758.30	No Bid	\$ 10,482.20	\$ 7,118.80
Section G - Youth Volleyball Uniforms	\$ 705.60	No Bid	\$ 1,280.40	\$ 439.20
Low bid highlighted in yellow				
Second lowest bidder highlighted in green				
Award bid to 2nd lowest bidder highlighted in blue				
Total Bid	\$ 33,374.67	\$ 27,353.10	\$ 47,854.44	\$ 24,684.20
Amount Awarded	\$26,863.29	\$2,000.90		\$2,509.08
Section Awarded	A, D, E, F	C		B, G